
 Rising artificial intelligence (AI) adoption, robust capex plans and emerging use cases are good
news for Asia, where firms are innovating in AI, according to Eastspring Investments’ portfolio
manager, Terence YT Lim.

“The high number of use cases for AI in Asia will drive broader AI adoption across the region
and increase the demand for AI infrastructure and compute resources to support this growth,”
he says.

“Businesses across Asia are adopting AI into their products and processes. For example, a
leading Taiwanese semiconductor chip manufacturer is leveraging a cutting-edge AI
computational lithography platform to enhance its production of photomasks, which are critical
tools used to imprint circuitry onto chips. Recently, the company reported that for every one
per cent productivity gain, it yielded cost savings of around US$338,000.”

At a consumer level, he says AI adoption has been slower. 

“Currently, chatbots are the primary use case; however, some smartphone makers in China are
rolling out their own AI-augmented operating systems with writing, editing and translation
capabilities. These developments are further positioning smartphones in competition with
existing dominant application ecosystems,” says Lim.

Asia’s role as an enabler and innovator is opening multiple opportunities across the region’s AI
ecosystem. 

“Firstly, Asia is home to almost 60 per cent of the global population, which represents a huge
base of end users that generate data, ideal for AI algorithms to learn from. As demand for AI-
powered services rises in the region, the need for low-latency, high-performance AI inferencing
becomes critical. As such, US and China hyperscalers are expanding their cloud presence in the
region to be closer to these end users.

“Secondly strong capex growth by US hyperscalers should benefit Taiwanese and Korean AI
chip supply chain players especially in the areas of foundry, High Bandwidth Memory (HBM),
ABF substrate (Ajinomoto Build-Up Film), PCBs (Printed Circuit Boards), ASIC (Application
Specific ICs) backend design, and server assembly,” he says.

Given the significant capital requirements and local presence needed to secure land and power
in the region, third-party data centre providers are well-positioned to capitalise on the growing
demand through leasing arrangements with hyperscalers. However, Lim says that some
companies are retaining some of their computing capacity rather than relying entirely on
hyperscalers due to concerns over data sovereignty, security and control.
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“In Korea and Malaysia, leading data centre providers are planning to more than double their

existing capacity. In Singapore, there is some capacity constraint due to a government-imposed

moratorium on new data centres. However, as enterprises prefer to keep their regional data in

Singapore due to a stable legal and political environment, third-party data centre providers can

enjoy premium rental rates that are four times higher than the industry average.

“At the same time, Chinese hyperscalers are driving revenue growth by moving beyond low-

value GPU rental services and enabling enterprise-level AI transformation with Model as a

Service (MaaS). By offering MaaS alongside traditional cloud services such as compute,

databases and storage, Chinese hyperscalers are creating sticky ecosystems.

“Although there have been frequent shifts in sentiment of AI-related stocks, creating significant

volatility, for active investors, dislocations are opportunities to create alpha.”

While the AI narrative has been impacted by recession fears arising from the US tariffs, rumours

of capex cuts by US hyperscalers, poor manufacturing yields of advanced server racks and

concerns over the commoditisation of Large Language Models (LLMs) and falling Graphics

Processing Unit (GPU) rental rates, Lim says the long-term outlook is strong.

“This is fertile ground for disciplined value investing to identify beneficiaries of the structural AI

theme. A margin of safety approach allows smart investors to buy on scepticism and profit as

fundamentals reassert themselves.

“Focusing on companies with durable competitive advantages at attractive valuations enables

investors to capture AI’s long-term growth upside while sidestepping frothy valuations. In

markets that oscillate between euphoria and scepticism, a patient, value-centric process can help

deliver consistent returns amid the noise,” says Lim.
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About GSFM

GSFM was established in 2007 as a subsidiary of the Grant Samuel Group. In 2016, Canadian wealth

manager CI Financial Corp, which oversees more than C$546.1 bn in funds under management (at 31

December 2024), acquired a majority stake in the business, previously held by Grant Samuel.

GSFM delivers comprehensive responsible entity services, operational support, commercialisation

assistance, and expert distribution and marketing for funds managed by leading local and international

investment managers, serving both Australian and New Zealand institutional investors as well as Australian

retail investors.

It has formed partnerships with nine specialist investment managers, who collectively manage more than

A$1.078 trillion.

Epoch Investment Partners: Based in the financial heart of New York, Epoch Investment Partners

specializes in global equity investing with a focus on free cash flow as the primary driver of returns.

Payden & Rygel: This independent investment management firm, headquartered in Los Angeles, is

renowned for its fixed-income expertise and a commitment to delivering client-focused investment

strategies for over three decades.

Munro Partners: An independent global equity manager from Melbourne, Munro Partners is recognized

for its forward-thinking approach, actively investing in innovative and growth-oriented businesses

worldwide.

Man Group: Headquartered in London, this global alternative investment management firm is focused

on pursuing outperformance for sophisticated clients via its Systematic, Discretionary and Solutions

offerings. Their single and multi-manager investment strategies are underpinned by deep research and

span public and private markets, across all major asset classes, with a significant focus on alternatives.

Tanarra Credit Partners: Specializing in private credit instruments, Australian based Tanarra Credit

Partners is dedicated to creating tailored credit solutions, offering unique investment opportunities in

niche credit markets.

Access Capital Partners: This European independent private asset manager is focused on private equity,

private debt, and infrastructure, providing investors with access to diversified private markets.

Eastspring Investments: As a global asset manager based in Singapore, Eastspring brings deep insights

and a disciplined approach to investments across Asia, catering to a wide array of asset classes.

Alantra: With a strong presence in Europe, Alantra specializes in small and mid-cap investments,

leveraging local knowledge to drive growth in niche markets.

Australian Entertainment Partners (AEP): Creators of the AEP Screen Fund, this investment vehicle is

dedicated to supporting Australian film and television projects, backing local talent and boosting the

creative industry.

GSFM currently has approx. $10.74 billion funds under management (at 31 May 2025).

For more information about GSFM, please visit the website gsfm.com.au or follow GSFM on LinkedIn.


